LAW OFFICES MALDIN, HAUSER. WARTELL, ROTH & HELLER. P.C,

STATE OF MICHIGAN

IN THE PROBATE COURT FOR THE COUNTY OF WAYNE

IN THE MATTER OF N Hon. Milton Mack

Irrevocable Trust. File No.

[ ) ol )

The Mall Malisow Firm, P.C, Maddin, Hauser, Wartel!, Roth & Heller, P.C.

Aftorney for Attorney for Bobrin as to Dudek’s Objection
Former Trustee 28400 Northwestern Highway, Suite 300

30445 Northwestern Highway, Suite 250 Southfield, Ml 48034

Farminiton Hills, Ml 48334 4

(P45580) c_ ]
Co-Trustee and Attorney for |l N | Kemp Klein Umphrey Endelman & May, P.C.
Irrevocable Trust - { Guardian ad Litem
615 Griswold Street, Ste. 518 201 W. Big Beaver Road, Suite 600
Detroit, Ml 48226 Troy, Ml 48084
L ]

R S PETITION FOR R_EIMBURSEME_NT OF ATTORNEY FEES
NOW COMES (NN by and through her attorneys, Maddin, Hauser,

Wartell, Roth & He!ler P.C., and for this Petition states as follows:
1. On or about March 1, 2007, Successor Trustee (NS ficd

objections to@ N NENNER: final account.

2. On Tuesday, October 16, 2007, this Court ruled that there was not a

scintilla of evidence in support of these objections, that there was difficulty in seeing any
advantage to the trust in filing these objections, and that \NEGEE: fces and
expenses should be reimbursed. |

3. This firm inéurred legal fees of $13,202.50 (using the undersigned's
discounted hourly rate) and costs of $1,021.26 through October 23, 2007 (Exhibit A).

4. This firm has incurred additional legal fees since October 23, 2007.
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5. The invoice of April 26,.2007 from Langnas & Associates, P.C., the former

firm of (R, shows an amount due at that time of $4,302.50. Of this amount,

- $2,447.50 has already been approved by this Court in approving (N final

account. That leaves an additional balance of $1,855.00 (Exhibit B).
6. The $2,447.50 approved by this Court in (| Sllls final account has
yet to be paid. ‘ |
7. G i .ed additional fees of $3,342.50 through October 23,
2007 (Exhibit C).
8. N s incurred additional fees since October 23, 2007.
WHEREFORE,—especﬁuIIy requests that she be reimbursed in the
amount of $19,421.26 for fees and costs through 10/23/07, and for further fees _and
expenses from October 24, 2007 to the date of hearing.
Respectfully submitted,
MADDIN, HAUSER, WARTELL,

By, ; ' e

Attorneys foiEENEEED =5 tof»

Objection to Attorney Fees and- All Accounts
Third Fleor Essex Centre
28400 Northwestern Highway

Dated: |1 /86 /@ 4 Southfieldl M-| 48034

698395




LAW QFFIZES MADDIN, HAUSER, WARTELL. ROTH & HELLER, R.C.

Exhilo -

STATE OF MICHIGAN
IN THE PROBATE COURT FOR THE COUNTY OF WAYNE

IN THE MATTER OF (N Hon. Milton Mack
lrrevocable Trust. Fite NogiE D>

The Mall Malisow Firm, P.C. !oti_roff & Abramczyk, P.C.
Attorney for Patricia E. Kefalas Dudek, | In pro per as to Petition for Attorney
Trustee Fees
30445 Northwestern Highway, Suite 30400 Telegraph Road, Suite 444
250 Bingham Farms, Michigan 48025
Farmington Hills, M! 48334 L )

_ c - 3
Kemp Klein Umphrey Endelman & Maddin, Hauser, Wartell, Roth & Helier,
May, P.C. P.C.
Guardian ad Litemn Attorney for Bobrin as to Dudek’s
201 W. Big Beaver Road, Suite 600 Objection _
Troy, Ml 48084 28400 Northwestern Highway, Suite

300

AEFFIDAVIT FOR ATTORNEY FEES AND COSTS
VR Ocing first duly sworn, deposes and states as follows
1. Attached as Exhibit 1 is this firm’s detail for fee and costs, associated with defending the
Objections to Final Account. The detail covérs the time period from inception through
October 23, 2007. For this time period, this firm incurred.lcgal fees of $13,202.50 and
costs 0f $1,021.26.
2, Attached as Exhibit 2 is the amount of time spent by each timekeeper on this file through

October 23, 2007.

3. The hourly time structure used to calculate Exhibit 1 is a discounted rate. Had the
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timekeepers’ general hourly rate been charged, this firm would have incurred legal fees

of $16,218.00 and costs of $1,021.26.

4. The above calculations do not include 0.9 hours spent by David M. Saperstein and 0.5

hours spent by G SNEENEEE i1 will not be billed.

5. The above calculations do not include time or expenses incurred on October 24, 2007 and

later.

FURTHER Affiant sayeth not.

Subscribed and sworn to before me

this 29 ¢ day of _ACfeter, , 2007

Notary !ubllc |—

County, State of
Actingin _- County
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES:

Notary Public, State o! Hichian

County of Wayne
My Comnission Expires Oct. 12, 2:'.)912
‘Acting in the County of O/ KA




Yillgdl and Unbilled Recap Of Time Detail - [06568-0026 - INSURED: (=

exhihit |

Page 1
CNA INSURANCE COMPANIES  10/24/2007 11:11:34 AM
08/11/2007 | HRH 0.40 78.00[RECEIPT AND INITIAL REVIEW OF MATTER; 06568-0028 1533627
| 6772012007 Invoice=135373 0.40 60.00]MEMORANDUM TO FILE
| 06/12/2007 | HRH — 1.00 195.00[TELEPHONE CONFERENCE Wi HUIEINDD: DB568-0026 1534018
0712072007 nvolcew138373 1.00[ _ 150.00|TELEPRONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNE
MANELA AND CONFIRM OUR INVOLVEMENT
081472007 | LYT 0.70 63.00[OBTAIN VARIOUS PAST LAWSUITS INVOLVING 0B568-0026 . 1534031
00007 inveice=138373 6,70 48.00[PLAINTIFF IN WAVNE CIRCUIT AND PROBATE GOURTS
6671412007 | DEM 0.60] " 132.00[REVIEW COURT MATERIALS FROM UNDERLYING GASES 0B566-0026 1536605
0772012007 Involce=138373 080] __ 100.00
0&715/2007 | DEM 0.40 66.00|PREPARE FOR CLIENT MEETING 06568-G026 1536615
G7IZ0/2007 involce=138373 0.40 50,00
vorsrzoor | oenv | 180] 297 00|INFIAL CLIENT MEETING 06588-0026 1636618
0775013007 Involoe=134373 180 335.00
oarsrzoor | _oev SN 020 33.00{CONFER WIT EGARDING INITIAL 08566-0026 1536620
07/20/2007 Invoice=138373 0.20 25.00[CLIENT MEETING
G6/16/2007 | _DEM 0.00(  148.50{REVIEW FILE MATERIALS 056680020 1630624
B7/20/2007 Invalce= 080 13260
oererzoo7 | AR | 200 380,00[SIX TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 06568-0026 1635373
0772072007 Invoice=138373 200] __ 300.00|COUNSEL FOR OBJECTING PARTIES; RECEIPT AND
REVIEW OF PROPOSED ORDER; MEETING WITH CLIENT,
ELEPHONE CONFERENGES ANE EMAIL
WITH EGARDING UPCOMING HEARING ON
TUESDAY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WiTH
CONVERTING ASSIGNMENT FROM SUBPOENA ASSISTANCE
TG FULL CLAIM
UBH0i2007 | DEM 170 280,50)MEMORANDUM TO FILE REGARDING INTTIAL CLIENT 08568-0026 1538650
0772012007 Involce=138373 7.70]_ 21250[MEETING
0G/16/2007 |__DM3 0.20 39.00|REVIEW OF MEMO FrRoN NI REGARDING 05588-0026 1636134
0772012007 Involoe=138373 020 30.00[iNTIAL MEETING
06/20/2007 | _DMS 0.10 19 50| TELEPHONE CALL FROM PLAINTIFF'S COUNGEL 06566-0025 1538287
0772072007 Involce=136373 0.10 15.00| REGARDING NEW HEARING DATE
0672012007 |_DMS 166] " 312.00[REVIEW OF FILE MATERIALS PROVIDED BY CLIENT 66568-0026 1656208
0772012007 Involce=138373 60| 24000
08/20/2007 | DMS 010} 19.80[TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANTS ATTORNEY 0B568-0026 538302
O7I20/2007 lvolcs=138373 0.10 15,00[REGARBING NEW HEARING DATE '
0612272007 | _DMS 010 19.50[TELEPHGNE CALL TG CLIENT REGARDING HER FILE 05566-0026 1538365
0772072007 Involee=138373 0,10 15.00
G6/22/2607 | OMS 0.40 78.00MEMO TO FILE REGARDING CONVERGATION WITH 08568-0025 1538429
0712012007 nvolce=136373 040 60.00[CLAIMANT'S ATTORNEY REGARDING HEARING ‘
06iZ6/2007 | OMS 050 97.50[ TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLIENT REGARDING INITIAL 06568-0025 1638497
07/20/2007 Involce=138373 0.50 75.00IMEETING
67812007 | DMS 0.30 58,50/ TELEPHONE CALLS X2 TOIFROM GLAIMANT'S ATTORNEY 06566-0026 1638499
“O7IZ02007 flavoioe=138373 0.:30 45 00|REGARDING SUBPOENA )
082612007 | DMS 0.70]  136.50LETTER TO CLAIM REPRESENTATIVE REGARDING 08568-0026 163850
0712072007 Involce=138373 0.70]  105.00|LITIGATION PLAN AND BUDGET
0710272067 | OMS 0.40 78.00[TELEPHONE CALLS X4 FROMITO CLIENT REGARDING Ga508-0028 1841525
BBHAIZ007 Involpe=138007 0.40 60.00]HEARING TO APPROVE FINAL ACCOUNTING ‘
070812007 | DM 0.20 39.00[TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLIGNT REGARDING DATE OF 06568-0026 1541067
581172007 Involce=120007 020 30.00|HEARING TO APPROVE HER FINAL ACCOUNT
0710512007 | MG 0.20 39.00[EMAILS X2 FROMITO CLIENT REGARDING FRODUCTION 065650025 1641431
O811412007 Invoice=139007 0.20 30.00]OF HER GLIENT FILE
O7I08/2007 | DMS 0.10 19, 50[MEMORANDUM TO FILE, REGARDING CONVERSATION WITH 065650926 1542277
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08/14/2007 Involce=138007 0.10 16.08|CLAIMANT'S GOUNSEL ABOUT SUBPOENA
07I0B/2007 | _DMS 0.80]  155.00[MEMORANDUM TO FILE REGARDING CONVERSATION WITH 06588-0026 1642278
08/1472007 involca= 138007 0.80[  120.00[CLIENT ABGUT PROCEDURAL HISTORY GF UNDERLYING

CASE
0771072007 | OB 0.8 156.00]2 TELEPHONE CALLS FROM CLIENT REGARDING HEARING 06568-0626 1642785
08/14i2007 Involce=135007 G.80] " 156.00| TRANSCRIPT
0774072007 | DMS 0.90]  175.60|RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF TRANSCRIPT GF JUNE 065880028 1542795
Ga/1472007 Invoice=139007 080 175.80|FEARING
67710/2007 | _ DM 0.30 45.00| TELEPHONE CALLS X2 FROMITO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL 06565-0026 1645335
0811472007 Involce=138007 6.30 45.08|REGARDING HEARING ON CLIENTS MOTIGN 1O APPROVE

ACCOUNT
O7712/2007 | DMS 0.30 58.50| EMAILS X3 FROM/TO CLIENT REGARDING RETURN OF 06568-0026 1542662
671472007 Involce=132007 6.30 58.60| ORIGINAL GLIENT FILE
07/13/2007 DMS5 0.20 35.00|LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING 08568-0026 1643076
0871472007 nvolce=139007 0.20 39.00|AVAILABLE DATES FOR RESCHEGULED HEARING
67fier2007 | DMS 0.20 30.00(EMAILS X2 FROM/TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING 06666-0020 1546001
0671472007 Involcex 139007 8.2 30.00[HEARING DATE ON CLIENT'S PETITION TO APPROVE

FINAL ACCOUNT
07/16/2007 | _DEM 0.10 12.50[ReViEW STATUS MEWMORANDUM FROVETEN 06568-0026 1644073
0811473007 Involce=138007 0.10 1260
Q772007 DM3 7.60 148200/ CONTINUED REVIEW OF CLIENT FILE 06568-0026 1544076
081472007 Invoice=139007 7.60 1.482.00
07712007 | DMS 0.0 0.00|EMAIL TO GUARDIAN AD LITEM REGARDING POSSIBLE " [oss65-0028 1644120
0811472007 involca=139007 0.00 0.00[HEARING DATES
G7717/2007 | DM 6.10 19.60]RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMANT'S 06568-0026 1544123
OB4/2007 | nvolce=139007 0.10 19.50|COUNSEL MANELA REGARDING HEARING DATES

T
Towriizoey | vy ” 0.50 45,00[MEETING WITH ATTDRNEP!EGARDING 06668-0026 1544013

08/ 1ai2007 nvoTce=139007 0.60 45.00JUPCOMING DISCOVERY IN CASE MATTER TO BE DONE
07A8/2007 | OMS 0.40 78.00|TELEFHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL 06566-0026 1544624
BHA2007 irivolce=139007 0.40 78.00|REGARDING HEARING DATE ON VARIOUS PETITIONS '
0711872007 | _ OMS 0.10 0.50|EMAIL TO GLAIMANTS ATTORNEY MANFIA REGARDING 06568-0026 1644545
bB/1472007 Involce=139007 0.10 19.50|PRODUCTION OF RECORDS PURGUANT TO SUBPOENA
071612007 | DMS 0.40 76.00[EMAILS X4 TOIFROM CLIENT REGARDING CONFERENCE 06365-0026 1644587
Ber4r2007 Involce=138007 0.40 78.00[TO DISCUSS HEARING TG APPROVE HER FINAL AGGOUNT
o7I8I2007 510 994 50|CONTINUED REVIEW OF CLIENT FILE 06566-0026 1544594
81412007 imvoice=139007 510 ow4e0
07972007 0.20 39.00|MEMGRANDUN TO FILE REGARDING GUNVERSATION WITH 0B568-0028 1541608
0871472007 Involce=136007 6.26 39.00|CLAIMANT'S ATTORNEY REGARDING HEARING
§7/76/2007 | DM 0.60] 117, 00/INTERNET RESEARCH REGARDING DEATH OFUD 065660026 1644760
8412007 Twolce=136007 0Bof 11740 NO LISTING I 501 WDEX ON ROOTSWEB.COM
07A9/2007 ‘ms__ 030 45.00[EMAILS X2 TO/FROM CLIENT REGARDING NEW HEARING 06568-0025 1645950
G8/1412007 Invoice=139007 S 45.00|DATE FOR PETITION TO APPROVE FINAL ACCOUNT AND

PRODUGTION OF DOCUMENTS
0712012007 | DMS 0.20 30.00[RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLIENT 06668-0026 1545946
Far 1412007 involce=130007 0.20 s0.05|REGARDING FOS TUION S TSERY
9772012007 | _DMS 0.60 90.00(PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING 06565-0026 is45627
SB71412007 Fivaloe=139007 0.60 90.00|CLAIMANT'S GPPOSITION TO HER FINAL ACCOUNT
374202007 | _OMS 0,90 " 135.00[DISCUSSION WITH CLIENT REGARDING CLAIMANTS 06554-0020 1545620
36/1472007 Involce=13 0.60] _ 135.00]OFPOSITION TO HER FINAL ACCOUNT
3772072007 | OMS 1.00] "150.00{TELEPHONE CALL TO GLIENT REGARDING ALLEGATIONS 005050026 1545858
16412007 Invoice=130007 1.00] __150.00[IN OBJECTIONS 10 FINAL ACGOUNT
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07/28/2007 | DMS 0,10 16.00]EMAIL FROM CLIENT REGARGINGJIJJIE FosT 10 065680026 1645870
081472007 Involes=139007 0.10 15.00|LISTSERV
07124/2007 | DS 0.80] ___ 126100|MEMORANDUM TO FILE REGARDING CONVERSATION WITH 06568-0026 1545860
Q8472007 Invoice=139007 0.80] " _120.00|CLIENT ABOUT ALLEGATIONS IN OBJEGTION TO FINAL
ACCOUNT
0772772007 | DS @10 15.60| TELEPHONE GALL FROM CLAIMANT'S GOUNSEL 065680026 1545847
QBHa/2007 Invoice=139007 0.10]  15.00|REGARDING NEW HEARING DATE
072172007 | DN 0.1 15.00/EMAIL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING NEW 0566-0026 1648330
081472007 Involce= 138007 0.10 15.00|HEARING DATE
07/2772007 | OMS 0.10 15.00]RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLIENT 06568-0026 1648351
08872007 Invaice=139007 0,10 15.00JREGARDING HEARING DATE ON PETITIONS
G7i30/2057 | _OMS 0.60 75.00|EMAILS X5 TOIFROM GUARDIAN AD LITEM 06565-0028 1548622
08/14/2007 Involce=139007 0.50 75.00 oI CUiERT, AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
REGARDING HEARING DATE
0773172007 | OMS 0.20 30.00| TELEPHONE CALL TO GUARDIAN AD LITEM REGARDING 08506-0026 7548638
08/44/2007 Involce=139007 0,20 30.00HEARING DATE
0713112007 DMS 0.10] 16.00;RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GUARDIAN AD 08568-0026 1540840
0BT 4/2007 Invalce= 139007 010 15.00]LITEM REGARDING HEARING DATE
0773172007 | _DMS 0.20 30.00| TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S ATTORNEY 06568-0026 1548341
0B 472007 voloe=139007 0.2 30.00[REGARDING HEARING DATE
0773712007 | DMS 010 15.00|TELEPHONE GALL TO CLIENT REGARDING HEARING DATE 06568-0026 1549842
0811412007 Involce=138007 Q.10 15.00,
0773172007 | DMS 6.10 16,00[EMAIL TO CLIENT REGARDING HEARING DATE 06565-0026 1548843
08/14/2007 Involce=139007 0.10] 15,001
oorzoar | oms | GRS 0.10 15.00[TELEPHONE CALL TO CLIENT REGARDING HEARING DATE 06668-0026 1650215
0616772007 Invaice=139831 0.10 15.00]FOR PETITIONS
0Bi03/2007 | _OMS 030 45.00| TELEPHONE CALLS X2 TO/FROM CLIENT REGARDING 06568-0026 1650283
08107/2007 Invoice= 139631 0.30 45,00 HEARING DATE ON PETITIONS
De0872007 | OMS Q 020] "~ 30.00[TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANTS COUNSERED 065583038 1850285
6510712007 Involce=130631 0.20 30.00/REGARDING HEARING DATE ON PETITIONS '
oawszov7 |~ oS | 0.20 30.00[LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S ATTORNEY REGARDING 06568-0026 1650384
0o1G712007 involce=136631 020 30.00|ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON PETITIONS
Gbio972007 | T BNE 640 15.00[EMAIL TO CLAIM REPRESENTATIVE REGARDING 65680026 1652188
05107/2007 Invoice=136631 0.10 15.00[ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING
0B/10/2007 | DMS 0.40 15.00]RECETFT AND REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GLAIM 06568-0026 1657180
0i772007 tvolce= 0,10 15.00|REPRESENTATIVE REGARDING NEW CLAIM
REPRESENTATIVE AFTER NEXT WEEK
08/12/2007 | DMS. 1.10] """ 765 00|BEGIN DRAFTING LITIGATION PLAN 06688-0026 1552318
09/07/2007 nvolce= 138631 1.10 165.00
08162007 | DMS 480 720.00|DRAFT LITIGATION PLAN 05568-0026 1654108
057712007 Involce=139631 480 720,00
0871772007 |__DMS 260] __ 390.00[DRAFT LITIGATION PLAN 06568-0028 1654100
09/07/2007 invoice=139631 2.60 580.00)
G9726/2007 | DMS 0.20 30.00[EMAILS X2 FROMITO CLIENT REGARDING NEW ADDRESS 06566-0025 1566366
AND GUR REPLY FOR MOTION
T0M47Z007 | DMS 0.20 30.00/EMAIL AND TELEPHONE CALL TO GUARDIAN AD LITEM 08568-0026 1570088
REGARDING REPORT ON FINAL AGCOUNT
10/4/2007 | DMS 5,10} " 76500|RESPONSE TO PETITIONER'S AMENDED OBJECTIONS 06568-6026 7670100
10/08/2007 | DMS 160 240.00|EDIT REFLY TO DUDEK'S AMENDED RESPONSE 70 06508-0036 1674652
CLIENT'S FINAL ACCOUNT
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1071072007 | MG 030 46.00[TELEFHONE CALLS X3 TOIFROM GUARDIAN AD LITEM 06568-0026 1672850
REGARDING UPCOMING HEARING
1071072007 | _DMS | Ay 0.2 30.00|RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF FAX FROM CLIENT REGARDING 06566-0026 1574361
CHANGE IN LAW REGARDING HOMESTEAD EXEMPTION
1072007 | ons | SN 0.20 30.00[REVIEW FAX FROM GUARDIAN AD LITEM OF REPORT 065650028 1572651
RECOMMENDING ALLOWANCE OF CLIENT'S FINAL
ACCOUNT
10A1/2007 | _DMS 280 420.00/EDIT REPLY TORNIF SFONSE TO CLIENTS 08568-0026 1572653
FINAL ACCOUNT
i |
1671472007 | NS 3.00f  450.00[REVIEW FILE N ORDER TO FINAUIZE REPLY TO 056568-0026 1572654 i
_ RESPONSE TO CLIENT'S FINAL AGCOUNT .
|
7071172007 | DMS 0.60 90.00[TELEPHONE CALLS X3 TO/FROM CLIENT REGARDING 06568-0025 1672689
HEARING GN PETITION 70 APPROVE AGCOUNT
Torzzo07 | ovs | 6.40 60,00/ TELEPHONE CALLS X3 TOIFROM GLIENT REGARBING DB5B3-0026 1672662

HEARING ON PETITIONS TO APPROVE FINAL ACCOUNT

10A2/2007 | DMS 2.60 380.00|FINALIZE REPLY Tl RESPONSE 7O CLIENTS 068568-0020 1672665
FINAL ACCOUNT - '
1011272007 | OMS 0.20 30.00{RECEIPT AND REVIEW GF FAX FROM GUARDIAN AD 08562-0026 1572666
LITEM REGARDING PETITION TO MODIFY GUARDIANSHIP
022007 | DMS 0.30 46.00|EMAILS X3 FROM/TO CLIENT REGARDING REPLY 7O 0G566-0026 16572648
AMENDED RESPONSE FROI
1015/2007 | OMS 040 60.00[RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF FAX OF 4 REPORTS FROM 0B568-0026 1673160
GUARDIAN AD LITEM
T0ME/2007 | DS .80 20.00|PHONE CONFERENGE WITH CLIENT TO PREPARE FOR 0B6568-0026 1673171
HEARING GN HER PETITION TO ALLOW ACCOUNTS
10/16/2007 | OMS 550]  625.00|PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE WitH GLIENT AND HEARING 06565-0028 1673176
IN COURT
10/1572007 | DMS 0.10 15.00{EMAIL TO CLIENT REGARDING GUARDIAN AD LITEM 06565-0026 1678183
REPORTS
“30M6/2007 | DMS ] 1.30 165.00|FINAL PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON CLAIMANT'S 085680028 - 1673611
- OBJEGTIONS
10/672007 | DMS 240 360,0D]ATTEND HEARING ON CLAIMANT'S OBJECTIONS AND 06568-0026 1673612
] CLIENT'S FINAL ACCOUNT
10/6/2007 | DOMS 0.70 105.00]MEETING WITH CLIENT POST-HEARING TO DISGUSS 085680026 1673614
STRATEGY
10/16/2007 | DMS 0,20 30.00[EMAILS X4 FROM/TO CLIENT REGARDING TRANSCRIPT 085680026 1573818
- OF HEARING ON CLAIMANTS OBJEGTIONS
101672007 | OWS 0.10 15.00[EMAIL TO CLAIM REPRESENTATIVE REGARDING HEARING 06566-0026 1673625
ON CLAIMANT'S OBJECTIONS
TOMT7I2007 | DMS .30 16.00]RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GLIENT 06568-0026 1674353
REGARDING ATTORNEY FEES
|
T0MBI2007 | MG .70 105,00 TELEPHONE CALL 7O CLIE_EGARDING OUR 0B5B8-0026 1574316 |
CLAIM FOR ATTORNEY FEES
T0/18/2007{ DMS 0.40] 60.00[TELEPHONE CALLS TO/FROM CLiEﬂﬁ 085680026 - 1574316
REGARDING ATTORNEY FEES
10/18/2007 | DMS 0.10 15.00[TELEPHONE CALL 7O G ARG 06588-0026 1574317

WILLINGNESS TO SETTLE CLAIM FOR ATTORNEY FEES

1018/2007 | DMS 0.10 15.00[EMAIL TO CLIENT REGARDING HER TIME SPENT IN 06568-0026 1674660
DEFENDING ALLEGATIONS OF WRONGDOING !
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| 10/19r2007 DMS 0.50 75.00{TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S ATTORNEY 0G568-0028 1574735
N REGARDING QUR ATTORNEY FEES
1011972007 DMS 0.20 30.00{EMAILS X2 TO/FROM CLIENTS REGARDING QUR CLAIM 0G566-0026 1674737
FOR*
IATTORNEY FEES
1019/2007 DMS .20 30.00[MEMORANDUM TO FILE REGARDING CONVERSATION WITH 065680026 1574767
PETITICNER'S COUNSEL REGARDING QUR ATTORNEY
FEES
10/49/2007 DM3 0.40/ €0.00{LETTER TQ CLAIM REPRESENTATIVE REGARDING 068568-0026 1674769
HEARING
UNBILLED TOTALS: WORK| 31,90 4,786.00(32 records
UNBILLED TOTALS: BILL: 31.80 4,785,00
BILLED TOTALS: WORK: 48.30 8,418,60|66 records
BILLED TOTALS: ®BILL: 48,30 7,763.00
GRAND TOTALS:  WORK: 80.20] 13,203.50[98 récords
GRAND TOTALS:  BILL: 80.20) 12,648.00
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08/19/2007 ) _ P TRANSCRIPT OF PROCEEDINGS 118559
0772072007 Invoice= 136373 &19/07
Voucher=181757 Paid Vendo Balancs= .00 Amount= 70.00
Pald: 3794 07/30/2007
06/1972007 | HRR MISC 1.00] -70.00 -70.00/voID CHECK U =T FATD 116874
0B/14120G7 Invoice=138007 1.00] -70.00 -70,00[DIREGTLY
Voucher=181989 Pald Vendorﬁaalamg 00_Atnolnt=-70,00
Paid: 3794 07/30/2007
06/26/2007 | HRH MISC T00]  930.26) 930.26]C2 LEGAL COFIES-FULL SERVICE 118323
07/1912007 linvoice= 0.00] 000 0.00
Voucher=181542 Paid Vandor=C2 LEGAL Balance= .00 Amount= 930,28
: Pald: 3786 07/19/2007
0872872007 | HRH MISC 1,00 -930.26 -030.28[C2 LEGAL-Reversal from Cancellad Vouther 161642 8627
071612007 Involce= 000 0.0 000
Vouchar=181766 Paid Vendor=G2 LEGAL Balance=.00 Amour=-930.28
Pald: 3786 O7/19/2007
0672812007 | HIRH CcP 100] 930,26 930,56[C2 LEGAL 120481
Voucher=183117 Pald Yendor=C2 LEGAL Balance= .00 Amount= 930.28
Pald: 78088 08/26/2007
Tor1izoo7 | AR AN |COURIER| 100 1200 12,00[8.L. COURIER-PARKING-WAYNE COUNTY PROBATE COURT, 27363
1011472007 | HRH h COURIER| 1.00|  20.00] 20.00/5.L.. COURIER- WAYNE COUNTY PROBATE COURT 121385
|
10122007 | vird NS COURIER 100! 400 4.00/5.L, COURIER-PARKING-WAYNE COUNTY PROBATE COURT 121364
T0/12/2607 | HRA ﬁ COURIER] 1.00 2000 20.00[S.L. COURIER- WAYNE COUNTY PROBATE COURT 121393
. | ‘
|
10[ 272007 HR@ COURIER 1.00] 1500 16.00}S.J.. COURIER- DELWER PACKAGE TO HARLEY D. 121384
MANELA, ESQ.
10A2/2007 | HRA OFFICEC 1.00] 2000 20.00|COURIER EXPENSE-DELIVER PACKAGE 10 LINDA G. 121424
: BOBRIN, ESQ,
UNBILLED TOTALS: WORK] 1,021.287 racords
UNBILLED TOTALS: BILL: 1,021.26
BILLED TOTALS: WORK: 0.004 records
BILLED TOTALS: BILL: 0.00
GRAND TOTAL,  WORK: 1,521.28)11 racards
GRAND TOTAL: _ BILL; 1,021.26
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06/20/2007 | DMS 0.80]  135.00[INTERNET RESEARCH REGARDING CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL 06568-0004 1636208
0672072007 | DEM 0.20 25.00]EDIT MEMORANDUN TO FILE 06668-0004 1538601
06/20/2007 | DEM 0.30 37.50[MEET Wi = G ARDING STATUS OF 0B568-0004 1535504
CASE
URBILLED TOTALS: WORK 140 187603 records
UNBILLED TOTALS: BALL: 140 18750
GRAND TOTALS:  WORK: 1.40 197.50(3 records
1.40, 187,50

GRAND TOTALS:  BILL:
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STATE OF MICHIGAN
IN THE PROBATE COURT FOR THE COUNTY OF WAYNE

IN THE MATTER OF (D Hon. Milton Mack

Irrevocable Trust, ‘ File No.

e e ]
The Mali Malisow Firm, P.C. Sotiroff & Abramczyk, P.C.
Attorney for Patricia E. Kefalas Dudek, | In pro per as to Petition for Attorney
Trustee Fees
30445 Northwestern Highway, Suite 30400 Telegraph Road, Suite 444
250 Bingham Farms, Michigan 48025
Farmington Hills, M 48334 N
E ... ==
Kemp Klein Umphrey Endelman & Maddin, Hauser, Warteli, Roth & Heller,
May, P.C. P.C.
Guardian ad Litem Attorney forngiiiiimas toUENNG

201 W. Big Beaver Road, Suite 600 Objection

Troy, Mi 48084 28400 Northwestern Highway, Suite
b 300

Southfield, Ml 48034

AFFIDAVIT FOR ATTORNEY FEES AND COSTS

QR b first duly sworn, deposes and states as follows

1. Attached as Exhibit 1 is this firm’s detail for fee aﬁd costs, associated with defending the
Objections to Final Account. The detail covers the time period from inception through

Arpil 26, 2007. For this time period, this firm incurred legal fees and costs of $4,302.50,




2. The above calculations do not include time or expenses incurred after April 26, 2007.

FURTHER Affiant sayeth not. ] M y %

Subscribed and sworn to before me

this t* dj;? J & 2007
- 4’( j”f;/’h /w%ﬁ “-q
Notary Publio, State of Michigan

Notary Public’ ‘publ, Stae of Wi
Oeldand County, State of M\dmo\ RN Mycmnmlfs?otg&plmu 05, ﬂm
Acting In W\A Oodond County Aating ln the Courty of Ootdondt

MYCOMMISSION EXPIRES: July & i




ety

24359 Northwestern Highway
Sulte 200 : e . . fo
Southfield MI 48075 '

Invoice submitted'to:

c/o (NS

Aprili 26, 2007

In Reference To D LGB

Invoice #37558

Professional services

Hrs/Rate . Amount
03/26/07 Telephone conference with judge's 1.50 262,50
clerk re: hearing; 175.00/hx
Correspondence sent to Attorney
re: answer to objections;
elephone conference with Attorney
;
Telephone conference with guardian
ad litem Buttiglieri;
'03727/07 Bppear at hearing re: amnual .account; 2.00 350700
: . ) 175.00/hx )
04/11/07 Preparation oflcorrespohdence,to - 0.80 140.00
.= L 175.00/hx -
Preparation of correspondence to
For professional services rendered : -4.30 §752.50
Prévious bélance : $3,550.00

Balance due : ' : $4,302.50




P

24359 Northwestern nghway
Suite 200
Sotthfield MI 4B0O75

Invoice submitted to:

c/o WD

Maxrch 26, 2007

In Reference ToNNNGENND LGB

Invoice 37355

Professional services

3/2/07 Review objections from Attorney

Telephone conference with guardian
ad litem;

Telephone conference with judgs's
clerk:

Preparation of reponse to objections;

3/14/07 Preperation of POS and NOH on
petition to allow accoufit; NOH and.
petition sent to client

3/21/07 Review correspondence from
Telephone conference with guardian
ad litem;

Telephone conference with judge’s
clerk;

Preparation of answer to objections;
Review and revise answers;
Correspondence sent to guardian ad
litem;

RHrs/ BaL’e

4.00
175.00/hr

0.20
50.00/hr

6.00
175.00/hx

Anmount
NO CHARGE

10.00

NO CHARGE




c/o N Page 2
T Hoursg Amount
For professional services rendered 10.20 . $10.00
Previous balance $3,540.00
Balance due $3,550.00
and

‘Please make all checks payable to !
please include your invoice number on- your check.

ﬁlso, we now

accept Visa, Mastercard and Discover credit and debit cards. Thank |

you and have a wonderful day.
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24359 Northwestern Highway
Suite 200 -
Sonthfield MI 48075

Involice submitted to:
c¢/o NiINGG——_—

February 26, 2007
In Reference Tof NGNS LGB
Invoice #37140 .

Professional services

Hrs/Rate ._Amount

02/19/07 Preperation of POS and NOH; 0.30 15.00
Correspondence sent to client with 50.00/hr

NOH and petition

02/23/07 Telephone call from O o .0.770 NO CHARGE
- trast management; 175.00/hr

Por professional services rendered 1.00 $15.00

Previous balance i $3,525.00

Balance due . $3,540.00

Pleaze make all checks payable to {(ijNDENENNUENENED -
please include your invoice number on your -check. Also, we now
accept Visa, Mastercard and Discover credit and debit cards. Thank
you and have a wonderful day. ' ' :




24359 Northwestern Highway
Suite 200 ' -
Southfield MI 48075

Invoir® submitted to:

January 26, 2007

In Reference To: [l NEND LGB -

Invoice 436903

Professional services

1/15/07 Preparation of Notice of Hearing and
: POS for annual account

| 1/19/07 Telephone calil from—re:

death of LaSaundra;
Correspondence faxed/e-mailed to

4

Correspondence sent to D vith
tax forms :

1/23/07 Correspondence sent to QNN
with interest income statement

For professional services rendered

Previous halance

Balance due

Hrs/Rate _Amount

0.30 15.00
50.00/hr

1.30 NO CHARGE
175.00/hr

0.20 10.00
50.00/br ‘

0.20 - 10.00

2.00 $35.00

$3,490.00

$3,525.00




R
24359 Northwestern Highway
Suite 200 :

Southfield MI 48075

Invoice submitted to:
</ o,
—— ]

December 27, 2006

In Reference To:uuiiiiiiis LGB

Involce # 36661

Profegsional services

Hrs/Rate é&ount

12/11/06 Meet with Attorney JEEESTe: ‘ 1.50 - 262.50
. account; 175.00/hr
12/13/06 Telephone conference with judge's 0.40 . 70.00
' administrative assistant re: 175.00/hr

adjourned date; _
Conference with guardian ad litem
concerning adjournment;

For professional services rendered. 1.90 $332.50
Previous balance o $3,157,50

Balance due $3,490.00

Please make all checks payable to NSRRI and
please include your invoice number on your check. B&Also, we now
accept Visa, Mastercard and Discover credit and debit cards. Thank
you and have a wonderful day.




24359 Northwestern nghway
Suite 200
Southfield MI 48075

Invoice submitted to

/o N

Novembar 27, 2006

In Reference To: vy

Invoice # 36457

11/03/06 Prepared Proof of Service, Notice of

11/13/06

11/14/086

Professional services

Hearing, letter and Verification of
Funds for annual account

Telephone call from Attorney
re: Southfield property,

Telephone call from Attorney iR
re: change to hearing date;
Telephone conference with judge’ 5

clexk re: adjournment;

For professional services rendered

Previous balance

Balance due

Please make all checks payable to

please include your invoice number on your check.
accept Visa, Mastercard and Discover credit and debit cards.

you and have a wondexrful day.

LGB

Hrs/Rate Amount

0.80 40.00
50.00/hx

0.30 NO CHARGE
ITS.QOIhr

0.50 NO CHARGE
175.00/hr

1.60 540,00

$3,117.50

$3,157.50

and

" Als0, we now

‘Thank




24359 Northwestern Highway
Suite 200 ' ‘ - R
Southfield MI 48075 : .

Involce submitted to:

October 25, 2006

In Reference To :— LGB

Invoice # 36254

Additional charges:

_Amount,
10/19/06 Filing Fee; - | ©20.00
Total costs ' $20,00
Previous balance : $3,097.50
Balance due ' $3,-117.50
Please make all checks payable to ' and

please include your invoice number on your check. Also, we now
accept Visa, Mastercard and Discover credit and debit cards. Thank
you and have a wonderful day.




P

s
24359 Northwestern Highway
Suite 200 :

Southfield MI 48075

Invoice submitted to:

IR

September 25, 2006

In Reference To:\jNEip LGB

Amount
Previous balance $3,097.50
Balance due ' . T $3,087.50

Please make all checks payable toq and
please include your involce number on your check. Also, now
. accept Visa, Mastercard and Discover credit and debit cards. Thank
you and have a wonderful day. :




24359 Northwestern nghway
Sulte 200
Southfield MI 48075

Involice submitted to
c/o

August 27, 2006

In Reference To:{ NG

Previous balance

Balance due

Please make all checks payable to

LGB

Amount
53,097.50

$3,087.50

and

please include your invoice number on your check, BAlso, we now
accept .- Visa, Mastercard and Piscover credit and debit cards. Thank

you and have a wonderful day




54359 Northwestern nghway

. Buite 200
Southfield MI 48075

Inveice submitted to:

July 26, 2006

Iin Reference To (NN LGB

JInvoice # 35653

Professional services

Brs/Rate  ____Amount
“7/24/06 Review file re: information 0.20 35.00
requested by successor trustee, 175.00/hx
For professional services rendered 0.20 $35.00
Previous balance , . $3,0862.50
Balance due . ‘ $3,097.50
‘Please make all checks payable to - , and

please include your invoice number on your check. Also, we now
accept Visa, Mastercard and Discover credit and debit carxds. Thank
you and have a wonderful day.




24359 Northwestern Highway -
Suite 200 - v
Southfield MI 48075

Invoice submitted to:

c/o (N

June 26,

2006 -

In Reference To(uiNEED LGB

Invoice # 35476

Professional services

06/0B/06 Telephone confeérence with?
@ ::: application for EIN;

06/13/06

067/14/06

Correspondence sent to
office w/ IRS documents;

Preparation of final account of
co-trustee; .
File account w;th probate court;
Appear ‘at.hearing xe: f£inal account;

‘Correspondence sent to bonding

agency with discharge;

For professional services rendered
Additional charges:
Acct., filing fee;

Total costs

Total amount of this bill

Hrs/Rate Amount.

0.40 70.00
175.00/hx

3.00 525.00
175.00/hr

3.40 $595.00

20.00

$20,00

$615.00




¢/ Page 2

jg’mount
Previous. balance $2,447.50
Balance due 7 ~ $3,062.50

Please make all checks payable to (jjjlINANEEEEENED -!d
please_include.your._invoice number on your check. Also, we now

accept Visa, Mastercard and Discover credit and debit cards.. Thank
you and have a wonderful day. :




24359 Northwestern nghway
Suite 200 T
Southfield MI 48075

Invoice submitted to:

c/o

May 26, 2006

in Reference To (i D>

Invoice {35287

4/26/06

5/11/706

5/19/06

Professional services

Appear at hearing re: resignation of

co~-trustee;

Telephone conference with
LaSalle Bank re: change of

trustee;

Correspondence sent to LaSalle Bank
with check numbe (IR to be
deposited; ‘

Telephorie call from _ re:

transfer of assets:

Raview correspondence faxed from P.
_ office re: transfer of
account.;

Telephone conference with
&/Lab“alle Bank re: change of

trustees;

Correspondence sent to LaSalle Bank
w/ court information and
instructions;

LGB

2.
175.

00
00/hx

.30
.00/hx

.20
.00/hr

.80
.00/hx

Hrs/Rate Amount

350.00

15.00

35.00

- 140.00




/o

FPage. 2

Hrs/Rate s Amount

5/22/06 Telephone call from (NN - : 0.20 35.00
transfer of account, status of 175.00/hx
ownership;
for professional services rendered 3.50 $575.00
Previous balance $1,872.50
Balance due $2,447.50
Please make all checks payable to and

please include your invoice number on your chedk. Alsc, we now:
accept Visa, Mastercard and Discover credit and debit cards. TYhank

you and have a wonderful day.




STATE OF MICHIGAN

IN THE PROBATE COURT FOR THE COUNTY OF WAYNE

IN THE MATTER OF i RNEe . Hon. Milton: Mack
Irrevocable Trust, File No

The Mall Malisow Firm, P.C, Sotiroff & Abramezylk, P.C.
Attorney for Patricia . Kcfalas Dudek, Trustee | In pro per as to Petition for Attoroey Fees
30445 Northwestern Highway, Suite 250 30400 'Tekgraph Road, Suite 444

Farmington Hills, MU 48334 Bingham Fums, Michiian 48025

emp Klein Unmphrey Badelman & May, P.C. Maddin, Hauser, Wartell, Roth & Heller, P.C.
Guatdian ad Litem Attotney for Bobrin #s to Dudek’s Objection
201 W. Big Beaver Road, Suite 600 28400 Northwestern Highway, Suite 300

Troy, Ml 4808& | Southfield, ML 44034
FIDA B, ESQ.

STATE OF MICHIGAN 3
) 88

COUNTY OF OAKLAND )

_bcing first duly swotn, deposes and states as follows:

1. 1f called as a witness, I am cotmpetent to testify in this mattet.
2. I did not keep contemporancous records of my time spent on this matier after
Apidl, 2007,

3. I have reviewed the Affidavit and time records prepared by SN

4, T have reviewed the Sunnﬁaxy of Titne Records (Bxhibit 1) involving myself
prepaved by R
5. I believe that this Summary of Time Records represents an accurate suiitnary

of my time speat in communications and meetings with the law fitin of
Maddin, Hauser, Wartell, Roth & Heller, P.C. duting the time petiod between

June 12, 2007 and October 19, 2007.

1003 ZORYYAY JJ0dIL08 TO06ZVOEPET AVd TE 2T NCR LO/9Z/TT




20013

6. During this time petiod, my houtly rate was $175.00 per hous.

7. The Summaty atiached as Exhibit 1 docs not roflect time that T spent

reviewing my file, gathering and researching muaterials, or otherwise preparing

for the hearing on this matret.

FURTHER Affiant sayeth not.

Subscribed and sworn to before me
this 19th day of November 2007

Notar¥/ Public ﬁm
Macomb  County, State 0 chigan

Acting in _Qakland County, State of Michigan
MY COMMISBION EXPIRES: Februarvy 24, 2012

ZORVALY JdJ0UILOS

TONBZVOBYET XVd TEET NOK §O/QZ/TT




SUMMARY OF TIME RECORDS INVOLVING (i

DATE: ATTY: | TIME: TRAVEL TIME; RATE PER HOUR @ $175.00  |DESCRIPTION:
6/12/07 HRH 1.00 $175.00|T/C with HRH
8/15/7 DEM 1.80 1.00 $490.001 Initial Meeting with client
6/15/07 HRH 0.40 $70.001T/C with HRE
6/22/07 DMS 0.10 $17.50{T/C with DMS
6/26/07 OMS 0.50 $87.50|T/C with DMS

712107 DMS 0.40 $70.06{TIC X4 with DMS
713107 DMS 0.20 $35.00|7/C with DMS
75107 DMS 0.20 $35.00|Emails fromfio DMS
7/10107 DMS 0.80 $140.00{ TIC with DMS
7H0/07 pMS 0.80 $140.00: T/C with DMS
7112107 BMS 0.30 $52_50|Emails fromfto DMS
7/18/07 DMS .40 $70.00| Emails fromfto DMS
7119107 DMS 0.30 $52.50) Emails fromfto DMS
7120/07 DMS 0.20 $35.00|Emails from/to DMS
7/20/07 DMS 0.90 $157.50 Discussion w/DMS
7120/07 DMS 1.00 $175.00| TIC with DMS
Ti2307 BMS 0.10 $17.50Emails from/to DMS
7127107 DMS 0.10 $17.50|Emails from/to DMS
7131107 DMS 0.10 $17.50{ T/C with DMS
7131107 DMS 0.10 $17.50{Emails from/toc DMS
8/1/07 DMS 0.10 $17.501T/C with DMS
8/3/07 DMS 0.30 $52.50{T/C with DMS
9/25/07 DMS 0.20 $35.00|Emails from/fto DMS
10/10/07 DMS 0.20 $35.00(|Fax to DMS
10/11/07 DMS 0.60 $105.00|T/C with DMS
19/12/07 DMS 0.40 $70.00{T/C with DMS
10/12107 DMS 0.30 $52.50|Emails from/to DMS
10115107 DMS 0.80 $140.00:T/C with DMS
10/15/07 DMS 0.10 $17.50|Emails from/o DMS
10/16/07 DMS 2.40 1.00 $595.00]Attend hearing
10716707 DMS 0.70 $122.50 | Mig with client/DMS
10/16/07 DMS 0.20 $35.00|Emails from/tc DMS
10117107 DMS 0.10 $17.50Emails from/to DMS
10/18/07 DMS 0.70 §122.50(T/C with DMS
10G/18/07 DMS 0.10 $17.50|Emails from/toc DMS

IS




SUMMARY OF TIME RECORDS _z<o_.<_zol_

DATE:

ATTY:

TIME: - TRAVEL TIME: RATE PER HOUR @ $175.00 |DESCRIPTION:
10/19/07 DMS 0.20 $35.00|Emails from/to DMS
TOTALS; i7.10 2.00 $3,342,50 .
TOTAL WITRAVEL: 19.10 _

898794v2




